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Access

Collection is open to all researchers. Access to Barack Obama Presidential Records is
governed by the Presidential Records Act (PRA) (44 USC 2201) and the Freedom of
Information Act (FOIA) (5 USC 552, as amended) and therefore records may be
restricted in whole or in part in accordance with legal exemptions.

Copyright

Audiovisual records in this collection were prepared by officials of the United States
government as part of their official duties are in the public domain. Researchers are
advised to consult the copyright law of the United States (Title 17, USC) which
governs the making of photocopies or other reproductions of copyrighted material.

Provenance

Official records of Barack Obama’s presidency are housed at the Barack Obama
Presidential Library and administered by the National Archives and Records
Administration (NARA) under the provisions of the Presidential Records Act (PRA).
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Processed by

Staff Archivists, 2024. Previously restricted materials are added as they are
released. 

Scope and Content Note

The materials in FOIA 24-65276-F are a selective, not necessarily all-inclusive, body
of documents responsive to the topic of the FOIA. Researchers should consult an
archivist about related materials. 

 

FOIA 24-65276-F requested video footage filmed during President Obama’s visit to
Seattle on October 21, 2010.  

 

This FOIA primarily contains footage of President Obama speaking and answering
question on women and the economy in the backyard of the Foss family’s house, a
visit to the Top Pot Doughnuts, and arrival to and departure from Seattle.

System of Arrangement

The materials in FOIA 24-65276-F are a systematic body of documents responsive to
the topic of the FOIA. Researchers should consult an archivist about related
materials.  

 

Documents responsive to this FOIA were found in these collection areas – White
House Communications Agency.

 

White House Communications Agency records are processed at the folder/videotape
level. While this method maintains folder/videotape integrity, it frequently results in
the incidental processing of videotapes that are not wholly responsive to the subject
area.
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Container List

Audiovisual Records

Communications Agency, White House (WHCA)

Edited Projects

Tape 1187 POTUS Speaks on Women and the Economy - 10/21/2010, 1 clip, 1
Release in Full.  (This video is duplicative of the video on Master Control Tape 1933
video.  This video can be made available upon request.)

 

Master Control

Tape 1933 President Obama Speaks on Women and the Economy - 10/21/2010, 1
clip, 1 Release in Full.

 

White House Television

Tape 2020 POTUS speaks on Women and the Economy - 10/21/2010, 4 clips, 4
Release in Full.

Tape 2021 University of Washington Political Rally (Senator Murray) - 10/21/2010, 3
clips, 3 Withheld in Full.

Tape 2098 University of Washington Political Rally (Senator Murray) - 10/21/2010, 11
clips, 11 Withheld in Full.

Tape 2169 Trip to OR, WA, CA, NV Arrivals, Departures, OTRs Disc No. 2 -
10/22/2010-10/23/2010, 1 clip, 1 Release in Full.

Tape 2039 Motorcade, 8 clips, 8 Withheld in Full.

Tape 2027 Arrivals, Departures, and OTRs Disc No. 1 and No. 2; TT: OR, WA, CA, NV,
MN, 22 clips, 21 Release in Full, 1 Withheld in Full.
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https://youtu.be/SZAGowIn3c4
https://youtu.be/SZAGowIn3c4
https://youtu.be/8IO0tbbPxiQ
https://youtu.be/8IO0tbbPxiQ
https://youtu.be/BLW_qtiaSwY
https://youtu.be/BLW_qtiaSwY

